Precint 1 - Hwy 22 Corsicana

Plant Rates BM Logistics D & T Services Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 6.50 10.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - FlexBase 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00

Flex Base 25.00 125.00 16.50 20.00 28.50

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 6.50 10.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00

110.00 125.00 101.50 105.00 113.50

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 NO BID 18.00 16.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 - 13.00 13.00 13.00

Total Cost 33.00 - 31.00 29.25 78.00

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 NO BID 18.00 16.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Type D Crushed Concrete 16.00 - 16.00 16.00 16.00

Total Cost 36.00 - 34.00 32.25 81.00

Blades Group Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.00 NO BID
Uvalde Material Rate - - - 510.00 -
- - - 590.00 -

Cemex - Blum Hauling Rate 15.57 14.20 13.57 17.40 15.50

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65

23.22 21.85 21.22 25.05 23.15

Cemex Hauling Rate 15.57 14.20 13.57 17.40 15.50

Blum, TX Material Rate - 3/8 Type D 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

21.57 20.20 19.57 23.40 21.50

Conners Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 10.50 14.25 9.75 12.00 12.35

Honest Ridge - Groesbeck Total Cost 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50

19.00 22.75 18.25 20.50 20.85

Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 15.50 14.00 13.50 17.30 15.00

Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50

Total Cost 24.00 22.50 22.00 25.80 23.50

Ergon Asphalt - Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00 NO BID
Temple, Tx Material Rate - Cationic Emulsion - - - 678.30 -
Total Cost - - - 703.30 -




Knife River Corp - South

Waco

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck, TX

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck

Rattler Rock
Blum

Rattler Rock
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Waste

Total Cost

Hauling

Material Rate - Flex Base

Hauling

Material Rate - Type C Rock

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

25.00 NO BID 25.00 20.00 25.00
93.00 - 93.00 93.00 93.00
118.00 - 118.00 113.00 118.00
10.50 14.25 9.75 12.00 12.00
10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
20.50 20.25 19.75 22.00 22.00
10.50 14.25 9.75 12.00 12.00
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
45.50 20.25 44.75 47.00 47.00
15.00 15.00 13.57 17.50 15.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
23.00 23.00 21.57 25.50 23.50
15.00 15.00 13.57 17.50 15.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
24.00 24.00 22.57 26.50 24.50
25.00 NO BID 10.90 12.00 25.00
89.00 - 89.00 89.00 89.00
114.00 - 99.90 101.00 114.00
25.00 NO BID 10.90 12.00 25.00
107.00 - 107.00 107.00 107.00
132.00 - 117.90 119.00 132.00
25.00 NO BID 10.90 12.00 25.00
110.00 - 110.00 110.00 110.00
135.00 - 120.90 122.00 135.00
NO Bid NO BID 60.00 40.00 NO BID
105.00 - 105.00 105.00 -
- - 165.00 145.00 -




Ben Melton
903-875-9228

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
Unlimited
$125.00 HR
$85.00 HR PER
Tandum

.23 per loaded
ton per mile
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max Qty:
None
Limitations

on delivery
schedule: None

Toby Hicks
254-292-8074

Number of
Trucks in
Fleet - Unlimited

Pct 1 - Pct 4 - $125/hn

Min Delivery Qty
20-25 Tons

Max Delivery Qty
25 Tons

Jason Drain
903-257-5365

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime

Min/Max

Delivery Qty:
None

Limitations on
Delivery Schedule
No Specifications

$125.00 per hr

$85.00 hr per tandum

.23 per loaded ton
per mile

Joey Watson
254-205-2055

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:
None

$125.00 hr
$85.00 hr tandum

Tommy
Montgomery
903-875-8194

Number of

Truck in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Open

Minimum

Delivery Qty: 13
Maximum

Delivery Qty: 25
Limitations on
Delivery Schedule:
One day notice
$17.50 East of HS
Pc.1-4 $200 per load
Belly dump

175 Tandum per load
$95 hr.




Precinct 2 - Kerens

Plant Rates BM Logistics D&T Services Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 6.00 11.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - FlexBase 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00

Flex Base 25.00 135.00 16.00 21.00 28.50

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 6.00 11.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00

110.00 220.00 101.00 106.00 113.50

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 22.00 NO BID 25.00 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 - 13.00 13.00 13.00

Total Cost 35.00 - 38.00 30.25 78.00

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 22.00 NO BID 25.00 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Type D Crushed Concrete 16.00 - 16.00 16.00 16.00

Total Cost 38.00 - 41.00 33.25 81.00

Blades Group Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 82.50 NO BID
Uvalde Material Rate - Rock Asphalt 50Ib bag/rock asphalt tote - - 510.00 -
N - - 592.50 -

Cemex - Blum Hauling Rate 17.00 16.20 16.50 18.85 18.50

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65

24.65 23.85 24.15 26.50 26.15

Cemex Hauling Rate 17.00 16.20 16.50 18.85 18.50

Blum, TX Material Rate - 3/8 Type D 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

23.00 22.20 22.50 24.85 24 .50

Conners Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 12.00 14.25 NO BID 13.50 13.25

Honest Ridge - Groesbeck Total Cost 8.50 8.50 - 8.50 8.50

20.50 22.75 - 22.00 21.75

Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 16.50 14.50 15.50 18.75 18.00

Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50

Total Cost 25.00 23.00 24.00 27.25 26.50

Ergon Asphalt - Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.50 NO BID
Temple, Tx Material Rate - Cationic Emulsion - - - 678.30 -
Total Cost - - - 705.80 -




Knife River Corp - South

Waco

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck, TX

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck

Rattler Rock
Blum

Rattler Rock
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Waste

Total Cost

Hauling

Material Rate - Flex Base

Hauling

Material Rate - Type C Rock

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

25.00 NO BID 28.00 20.00 25.00
93.00 - 93.00 93.00 93.00
118.00 - 121.00 113.00 118.00
13.00 14.25 14.00 13.50 12.75
10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
23.00 20.25 24.00 23.50 22.75
13.00 14.25 14.00 13.50 12.75
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
48.00 20.25 49.00 48.50 47.75
20.00 16.00 16.50 18.85 18.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
28.00 24.00 2450 26.85 26.50
20.00 16.00 16.50 18.85 18.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
29.00 25.00 25.50 27.85 27.50
25.00 NO BID 10.00 10.00 25.00
89.00 - 89.00 89.00 89.00
114.00 - 99.00 99.00 114.00
25.00 NO BID 10.00 10.00 25.00
107.00 - 107.00 107.00 107.00
132.00 - 117.00 117.00 132.00
25.00 NO BID 10.00 10.00 25.00
110.00 - 110.00 110.00 110.00
135.00 - 120.00 120.00 135.00
NO Bid NO BID NO BID 40.00 NO BID
- - - 105.00 -

145.00




Ben Melton
903-875-9228

Toby Hicks
254-292-8074

Jason Drain
903-257-5365

Joey Watson
254-205-2055

Tommy
Montgomery
903-875-8194

Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Fleet Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet Truck in Fleet
Unlimited Fleet - Unlimited Fleet (Unlimited) (Unlimited) (Unlimited)
$125.00 HR Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$85.00 HR PER Anytime Anytime Open
Tandum Pct 1 - Pct 4 - $125/hii Min/Max Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None None Maximum
Delivery Time: 20-25 Tons Limitations on Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty Delivery Schedule | $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25Tons No Specifications | $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None One day notice
Limitations $125.00 per hr $17.50 East of HS
on delivery $85.00 hr per tandum Pc.1-4 $200 per load
schedule: None .23 per loaded ton Belly dump
per mile 175 Tandum per load

$95 hr.
Tandum Pct 2 $25.50/TN Flat Rate Charge Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Pct 1 - $160.00 Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None Maximum
Delivery Time: 23-24/per truck Need 1 - 2 days Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty notice $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25-26/per truck $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None .23 per loaded None
Limitations ton per mile
on delivery

schedule: None




Precinct 3 - Richland

Plant Rates BM Logistics D&T Services Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 125.00 NO BID 10.25 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - FlexBase - 10.00 - 10.00 10.00

Flex Base - 135.00 - 20.25 28.50

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 125.00 NO BID 10.25 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix - 95.00 - 95.00 95.00

- 220.00 - 105.25 113.50

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Waste - - - 13.00 13.00

Total Cost - - - 30.25 78.00

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Type D Crushed Concrete - - - 16.00 16.00

Total Cost - - - 33.25 81.00

Blades Group Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.10 NO BID
Uvalde Material Rate - Rock Asphalt 50Ib bag/rock asphalt tote - - 510.00 -
- - - 590.10 -

Cemex - Blum Hauling Rate 17.00 16.95 NO BID 18.85 18.50

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 7.65 7.65 - 7.65 7.65

24.65 24.60 - 26.50 26.15

Cemex Hauling Rate 17.00 16.95 NO BID 18.85 18.50

Blum, TX Material Rate - 3/8 Type D 6.00 6.00 - 6.00 6.00

23.00 22.95 - 24.85 24 .50

Conners Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 12.00 10.25 NO BID 10.90 10.50

Honest Ridge - Groesbeck Total Cost 8.50 8.50 - 8.50 8.50

20.50 18.75 - 19.40 19.00

Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 18.00 17.25 NO BID 0 18.00 18.00

Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 - 8.50 8.50

Total Cost 26.50 25.75 - 26.50 26.50

Ergon Asphalt - Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.99 NO BID
Temple, Tx Material Rate - Cationic Emulsion - - - 678.30 -
Total Cost - - - 697.29 -




Knife River Corp - South

Waco

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck, TX

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck

Rattler Rock
Blum

Rattler Rock
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Waste

Total Cost

Hauling

Material Rate - Flex Base

Hauling

Material Rate - Type C Rock

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

20.00 NO BID NO BID 17.50 25.00
93.00 - - 93.00 93.00
113.00 - - 110.50 118.00
13.00 10.25 NO BID 10.90 10.50
10.00 10.00 - 10.00 10.00
23.00 20.25 - 20.90 20.50
13.00 10.25 NO BID 10.90 10.50
35.00 35.00 - 35.00 35.00
48.00 20.25 - 45.90 45.50
20.00 17.00 NO BID 18.00 18.50
8.00 8.00 - 8.00 8.00
28.00 25.00 - 26.00 26.50
20.00 17.00 NO BID 18.00 18.50
9.00 9.00 - 9.00 9.00
29.00 26.00 - 27.00 27.50
25.00 NO BID NO BID 13.50 25.00
89.00 - - 89.00 89.00
114.00 - - 102.50 114.00
25.00 NO BID NO BID 13.50 25.00
107.00 - - 107.00 107.00
132.00 - - 120.50 132.00
25.00 NO BID NO BID 13.50 25.00
110.00 - - 110.00 110.00
135.00 - - 123.50 135.00
NO Bid NO BID NO BID 40.00 NO BID
- - - 105.00 -

145.00




Ben Melton
903-875-9228

Toby Hicks
254-292-8074

Jason Drain
903-257-5365

Joey Watson
254-205-2055

Tommy
Montgomery
903-875-8194

Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Fleet Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet Truck in Fleet
Unlimited Fleet - Unlimited Fleet (Unlimited) (Unlimited) (Unlimited)
$125.00 HR Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$85.00 HR PER Anytime Anytime Open
Tandum Pct 1 - Pct 4 - $125/hii Min/Max Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None None Maximum
Delivery Time: 20-25 Tons Limitations on Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty Delivery Schedule | $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25Tons No Specifications | $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None One day notice
Limitations $125.00 per hr $17.50 East of HS
on delivery $85.00 hr per tandum Pc.1-4 $200 per load
schedule: None .23 per loaded ton Belly dump
per mile 175 Tandum per load

$95 hr.
Tandum Pct 2 $25.50/TN Flat Rate Charge Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Pct 1 - $160.00 Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None Maximum
Delivery Time: 23-24/per truck Need 1 - 2 days Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty notice $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25-26/per truck $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None .23 per loaded None
Limitations ton per mile
on delivery

schedule: None

Precinct 3 - Dawson

Plant Rates BM Logistics D&T Services Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 125.00 NO BID 12.00 18.50
Corsicana Material Rate - FlexBase - 10.00 - 10.00 10.00
Flex Base - 135.00 - 22.00 28.50

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate NO BID 125.00 NO BID 12.00 18.50
Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix - 95.00 - 95.00 95.00
- 220.00 - 107.00 113.50




Big City Crushed Stone
Dallas

Big City Crushed Stone
Dallas

Blades Group
Uvalde

Cemex - Blum

Cemex
Blum, TX

Conners
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck

Conners Construction Co
Greenwade - Whitney

Ergon Asphalt -
Temple, Tx

Knife River Corp - South
Waco

Knife River Corp - South
Groesbeck, TX

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Waste
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Type D Crushed Concrete
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Rock Asphalt 50Ib bag/rock asphalt tote

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3/8 Type D

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Cationic Emulsion
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2
Total Cost

NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

- - - 13.00 13.00

- - - 30.25 78.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

- - - 16.00 16.00

- - - 33.25 81.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID 79.50 NO BID
- - 510.00 -

- - - 589.50 -

17.00 12.45 NO BID 12.10 12.80

7.65 7.65 - 7.65 7.65
24.65 20.10 - 19.75 20.45
17.00 12.45 NO BID 12.10 12.80
6.00 6.00 - 6.00 6.00
23.00 18.45 - 18.10 18.80
12.00 10.25 NO BID 10.25 11.00
8.50 8.50 - 8.50 8.50
20.50 18.75 - 18.75 19.50
16.00 11.75 NOBID 0 11.94 15.00
8.50 8.50 - 8.50 8.50
24.50 20.25 - 20.44 23.50
NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.29 NO BID

- - - 678.30 -

- - - 693.59 -
20.00 NO BID NO BID 11.00 25.00
93.00 - - 93.00 93.00

113.00 - - 104.00 118.00
12.50 10.25 NO BID 10.99 11.00
10.00 10.00 - 10.00 10.00
22.50 20.25 - 20.99 21.00




Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 12.50 10.25 NO BID 10.99 11.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Waste 35.00 35.00 - 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 47.50 20.25 - 45.99 46.00
Rattler Rock Hauling 20.00 12.25 NO BID 12.99 12.80
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base 8.00 8.00 - 8.00 8.00
28.00 20.25 - 20.99 20.80
Rattler Rock Hauling 20.00 12.25 NO BID 12.99 12.80
Blum Material Rate - Type C Rock 9.00 9.00 - 9.00 9.00
29.00 21.25 - 21.99 21.80
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 25.00 NO BID NO BID 14.50 25.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand 89.00 - - 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 114.00 - - 103.50 114.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 25.00 NO BID NO BID 14.50 25.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix 107.00 - - 107.00 107.00
Total Cost 132.00 - - 121.50 132.00
Texas Bit Hauling Rate 25.00 NO BID NO BID 14.50 25.00
Malakoff Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix 110.00 - - 110.00 110.00
Total Cost 135.00 - - 124.50 135.00
Waller County Asphalt Hauling Rate NO Bid NO BID NO BID 40.00 NO BID
Hempstead, TX Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334 - - - 105.00 -
- - - 145.00 -
Ben Melton Toby Hicks Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 254-292-8074 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery
903-875-8194
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Fleet Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet Truck in Fleet
Unlimited Fleet - Unlimited Fleet (Unlimited) (Unlimited) (Unlimited)
$125.00 HR Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$85.00 HR PER Anytime Anytime Open
Tandum Pct 1 - Pct 4 - $125/hif Min/Max Min/Max Minimum




.23 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None None Maximum
Delivery Time: 20-25 Tons Limitations on Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty Delivery Schedule | $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25Tons No Specifications | $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None One day notice
Limitations $125.00 per hr $17.50 East of HS
on delivery $85.00 hr per tandum Pc.1-4 $200 per load
schedule: None .23 per loaded ton Belly dump

per mile 175 Tandum per load

$95 hr.

Tandum Pct 2 $25.50/TN Flat Rate Charge Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Pct 1 - $160.00 Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None Maximum
Delivery Time: 23-24/per truck Need 1 - 2 days Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty notice $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25-26/per truck $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None .23 per loaded None
Limitations ton per mile




Precinct 4 - Blooming Grove

Plant Rates BM Logistics D&T Services Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 10.00 12.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - FlexBase 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00

Flex Base 25.00 135.00 20.00 22.00 28.50

Big Creek Construction Hauling Rate 15.00 125.00 10.00 12.00 18.50

Corsicana Material Rate - Hot Mix 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00

110.00 220.00 105.00 107.00 113.50

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 - - 13.00 13.00

Total Cost 33.00 - - 30.25 78.00

Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 NO BID NO BID 17.25 65.00

Dallas Material Rate - Type D Crushed Concrete 16.00 - - 16.00 16.00

Total Cost 36.00 - - 33.25 81.00

Blades Group Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.15 NO BID
Uvalde Material Rate - Rock Asphalt 50Ib bag/rock asphalt tote - - 510.00 -
- - - 590.15 -

Cemex - Blum Hauling Rate 10.50 11.80 12.00 12.00 13.00

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65 7.65

18.15 19.45 19.65 19.65 20.65

Cemex Hauling Rate 10.50 11.80 12.00 12.00 13.00

Blum, TX Material Rate - 3/8 Type D 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00

16.50 17.80 18.00 18.00 19.00

Conners Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 10.50 10.50 11.00 12.00 13.00

Honest Ridge - Groesbeck Total Cost 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50

19.00 19.00 19.50 20.50 21.50

Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 10.50 11.50 10.99 12.00 14.50

Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50

Total Cost 19.00 20.00 19.49 20.50 23.00

Ergon Asphalt - Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.00 NO BID
Temple, Tx Material Rate - Cationic Emulsion - - - 678.30 -

Total Cost

696.30




Knife River Corp - South

Waco

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck, TX

Knife River Corp - South

Groesbeck

Rattler Rock
Blum

Rattler Rock
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Waste

Total Cost

Hauling

Material Rate - Flex Base

Hauling

Material Rate - Type C Rock

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

20.00 NO BID NO BID 11.50 25.00
93.00 - - 93.00 93.00
113.00 - - 104.50 118.00
10.50 10.50 11.00 12.00 13.00
10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
20.50 20.25 21.00 22.00 23.00
10.50 10.50 11.00 12.00 13.00
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
45.50 20.25 46.00 47.00 48.00
10.50 11.50 10.99 12.00 12.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
18.50 19.50 18.99 20.00 20.50
10.50 11.50 10.99 12.00 12.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
19.50 20.50 19.99 21.00 21.50
25.00 NO BID 14.00 14.00 25.00
89.00 - 89.00 89.00 89.00
114.00 - 103.00 103.00 114.00
25.00 NO BID 14.00 14.00 25.00
107.00 - 107.00 107.00 107.00
132.00 - 121.00 121.00 132.00
25.00 NO BID 14.00 14.00 25.00
110.00 - 110.00 110.00 110.00
135.00 - 124.00 124.00 135.00
NO Bid NO BID NO BID 40.00 NO BID
- - - 105.00 -

145.00




Ben Melton Toby Hicks Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 254-292-8074 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery
903-875-8194
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Fleet Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet Truck in Fleet
Unlimited Fleet - Unlimited Fleet (Unlimited) (Unlimited) (Unlimited)
$125.00 HR Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$85.00 HR PER Anytime Anytime Open
Tandum Pct 1 - Pct 4 - $125/hrf Min/Max Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None None Maximum
Delivery Time: 20-25 Tons Limitations on Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty Delivery Schedule | $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25 Tons No Specifications | $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None One day notice
Limitations $125.00 per hr $17.50 East of HS
on delivery $85.00 hr per tandum Pc.1-4 $200 per load
schedule: None .23 per loaded ton Belly dump
per mile 175 Tandum per load
$95 hr.
Tandum Pct 2 $25.50/TN Flat Rate Charge Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Pct 1 - $160.00 Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None Maximum
Delivery Time: 23-24/per truck Need 1 - 2 days Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty notice $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25-26/per truck $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None .23 per loaded None
Limitations ton per mile
on delivery

schedule: None
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